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sexuality, relationships, and sexual 
assault issues. A staff member from 
the office chairs the Campus Safety 
Committee which coordinates various 
educational programs regarding 
campus safety and crime prevention. 
The Dean of Students Office also 
administers the enforcement of the 
Student Code of Conduct and Visitor 
Code of Conduct, including resolving 
sexual offense allegations under these 
policies.  
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Act, 21 U.S.C. 812, and implementing 
regulations, 21 CFR 1308.11-1308.15. 
Controlled substances include, but are not 
limited to, marijuana, cocaine (including 
"crack"), amphetamines, heroin, PCP, 
hallucinogens, and certain prescription 
drugs. Illegal uses of alcohol include, but 
are not limited to, serving, buying or 
drinking alcohol by a minor; assisting a 
minor or an intoxicated person to get 
alcohol; selling alcohol without a license 
and driving while under the influence. 
This policy is not intended to supersede 
or negate any existing policies on 
substance abuse, student or employee 
discipline, or any additional requirements 
imposed on The University of New 
Mexico Gallup Campus or its students, 
faculty or staff by federal or state law. 
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